Section Il
How to Create an RFx Response

Create an RFx Response

NAGIC

Work Instruction

Transaction Code(s):

Purpose

Use this procedure to submit an RFx Response.

Trigger

Perform this procedure when your company would like to respond to a RFx invitation.
Menu Path

N/A

Transaction Code

Helpful Hints

Attachments should include blue print, Statement of work, Material list, or other
informational documents needed to help select an RFx response.

RFx Response is a bid to complete work or provide products to the State of Mississippi.

Procedure

1. Start the transaction.

Work Center Overview - State of Mississippi - MAGIC Portal - Windows Internet Explorer

== Sup;
= . The s er is the central point for suppliers
a upplier Work Center by clicking on the

a

Self-Service Work Center — Purchase Orders
5 Self-Service Work Center o |
= —

A ation
RFx and Auctions




2. Click RFx and Auctions Icon. .

Active Queries

-
Active Queries
eRFxs Al (23) Published Ended (0) Complated (1
Without Category Assig New Query (0
eRFxs - All
| = Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance
RFx Number: <o To [
RFx Status:
My R From: I 52
Smart Number:
Agency: To! ﬂ =
o I &
Commodity: > l _Qj To IJJ LY
Buyer: o . To | a_‘ 4
case | | [ Display Event || Dispiay Response | | [ Prit Preview | ||[ Refrash [ Export. |
B RFx Number Event Type EventStatus Start Date End Date ) R Status Event Version Response Vel
| 1120-14-R-IFED-00105-V01  Invitation for Bid = Published 01/24/2014 | 02/04/2014 Submitted
1130-14-R-IFBD-00101 Invitation for Bid | Published 01/24/2014  02/04/2014 No Bid Created 1
1130-14-R-IFED-00100 Invitation for Bid | Published 01/23/2014 | 01/12/2015 No Bid Created 1
1130-14-R-IFBD-00033 Invitation for Bid = Published 01222014 | 01/31/2014 No Bid Created
3374-14.R-IFED-D00%8 Invitation for Bid = Published 01/22/2014 | 02/07/2014 No Bid Created 1
3374-14-R-IFBD-00057 Invitation for Bid = Published 01/22/2014 | 02/05/2014 No Bid Created 1 ~
<4 >
3. As required, complete/review the following fields:
Field R/O/C Description
. Example:
RFx Number: Required P
Active Queries
Active Queries =
eRFxs AN{23) Published (1) Ended (0) Completed
i c y 5 New Query (O]
eRFxs - All
[~ Hide Guick Criteria Maintenance
RFx Number: < [3180000237] | To | =
RFx Status: L 7]7
My Responses From
Smart Number:
Agency L) I = | =
Commodity: Tol - = =
Buyer: To L a ﬁ 2
View:({Staodars Veew] [ | [ Crowie eseonee ] | [ Dpiny Event | Dpiay Reseonae | I o erevime ]|
Ef. Event Number RFx Number Event Type Event Status St:nrt Date End Date Number Status Event Version Response Ver
| 2%e 1130-14-R-IFBD-00105-VO1 | Invitation for Bid Published 01/24/2014 | 02/04/2014 Submitted
1130-14-R-IFBD-00101 Invitation for Bid Publshed 01/24/2014 02/04/2014 No Bid Created
1130-14-R-IFBD-00100 Invitation for Bid Published 01/23/72014 011222015 No Bid Created
1130-14-R-IFBD-00052 Invitation for Bid Publishad 01/22/2014 | 01/31/2014 No Bid Created
3374-14-R-IFBD-00058 Invitation for Bid Published 01/22/2014 02/07/2014 No Bid Created
3374-14-R-IFBD-00057 Invitation for Bid Published 01/22/2014  02/05:2014 No Bid Created d
« »
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4

. Click Apply [###¥ | to apply the search criteria.

eRFxs All{23) Published (1) Ended {0) Completed (1)
Without Category Assignment New Query (0)
eRFxs - All
| w Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance
RFx Number: © [3160000231 ol ] &
Rx Status: [T~
My Responses From: l:EI
Smart Number: [ |
Agency: @ o A 4
Commodity: o[ © w @e
Buyer o ] I = | R
View: | [ View] ] | [ Create Response | | [ Dispiay Event | Display Response | | [ Print Preview | |/ Refresh |[ Export 4 |
E. Event Number RFx Number Event Typs Event Status  Start Date  End Date  Response Number Response Status  Event Version
J 3180000236 1120-14-R-IFBD-00105-V01 | Invitation for Bid | Published 01/24/2014 | 02/04/2014 | 000000038 Submitted
3160000252 1130-14-R-IFBD-00101 Invitation for Bid | Published 01/24/2014 | 02/04/2014 No Bid Created 1
3160000291 1130-14-R-IFBD-00100 Invitation for Bid | Published 01/23/2014 | 01/12/2015 No Bid Creatad 1
3160000283 1130-14-R-IFBD-00052 Invitation for Bid = Published 01/22/2014 | 01/21/2014 No Bid Created
J 3160000282 3374-14-R-IFBD-00058 Invitation for Bid | Published 01/22/2014 | 02/07/2014 No Bid Created 1
I 3160000281 3374-14-R-IFBD-00057 Invitation for Bid | Published 01/22/2014 | 02/05/2014 No Bid Created 1
<!
Active Queries
-

Active Queries

eRFxs AN(23) Publshed (1) Ended (0) Completed (1)

Without Category Assignment New Query (0)

eRFxs - All

| = Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance

RFx Number: © [3160000251] ] o ] 4

RFx Status: =

My R From: l'l

Smart Number: [ ]

Agency: o[ 1Nl o[ Al ®

Commodiy: ° W @A

Buyer: < 1) I = | 4

[Aeply ][ Ciear]

View: | [Standard View) [®] |/[ Create Response | | [ Display Event || Display Response | | [ Print Preview | || [Refresh |[Exporta ]

Ff. Event Number RFx Number Event Type Event Status  Start Date End Date  Response Number Response Status  Event Version Response Vel
2180000294 1130-14-R-IFED-00105-VO1  Invitation for Bid = Published 01/24/2014 | 02/04/2014 | 8000000034 Submitted
3180000292 1130-14-R-IFED-00101 Invitation for Bid = Published 01/24/2014 | 02/04/2014 NoBid Created 1
3180000231 | 1120-14-R-IFBD-00100 Invitation for Bid | Published | 01/232014 | 01/12:2015 NoBid Created | 1
3180000283 1130-14-R-IFBD-00033 Invitation for 8id = Published 01/2272014 | 01/31/2014 No Bid Craated
2180000282 3374-14-R-IFBD-000%8 Invitation for Bid = Published 01/22/2014 | 02/07/2014 No Bid Created 1
3180000281 3374-14-R-IFBD-00057 Invitation for Bid = Published 01/22/2014 | 02/05/2014 No Bid Created 1

<!

la
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5. Click Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance ¥ H# Guick Critera Mastenance

Active Queries

-
Betive Queries [
eRFas All{1) Fubli
Witheut Category Assignment Mew Qweny [0
eRFxs - All
t b Show Quick Criteria Maintenance |
View: | [Standard View] [=] | [Ce= = | Frint Freview | | [ Refresh || Export 4
E. Ewent Numbsr  RFx Number Event Type Event Status  Start Date End Date Response Number Response Status  Event Version  Response Version
1 1130-14-R-IFBD-00100 | Invitation for Bid | Published 0172372014 | 011272015 Mo Bid Created 1
-
4 vl
6. Click 3160000291 .
Display RFx 3160000291
Display RFx : 3160000291 Help
RFx Number 2180000291 Smart Number 1130-14-R-IFBD-00100 RFX Status Published RFx Start Date 01/23/2014 18:30:00 CST Remaining Time 238 Days 02:32:17
RFx Owner Mr. Sims Harman RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Version
[Frint Freview | | [Rafresh | | [[Participate | [ Tentative | [ Create | [ Questions and Answers (0 | [ Export |
RFY Information ltems ¢ Motes and Attachments
| RFx Parameters | Questions | Mote and | Conditi | Pay
Time Zane: =5 Bidder Submission Deadiine Date:[12/31/2014
Firw i GilEEETE ||l Bidder Submission Deadiine Time:[01:30:00 pm
Opening Date: * 01/10v/2015 12:00:00 am
End of Binding Period:
Currency: UsD
~w Partners and Delivery Information =1
il |[ Call |[ Ciear | Filter Sattings
MNumber Name Phone Number
Sims Harman 404 5755122
MS DEFT FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION
@qpmvm| [Refresh | | [P | [Tentative | [ Creat= 1 it

and Answers {0 ) | [ Export |
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7. Click Participate [Particiest=, This step is required and notifies the SoMs your intent
to create a RFxresponse.
8. Click Create Response | ©r=st= Respanss|

Create RFx Response

Create RFx Response Help
RFx Response Number S000000038 RFx Number 3180000251 Status In Process Submission Deadline 12/31/2014 13:30:00 C5T Opening Date 01/10v2015 00:00:00 CST
Remaining Time 338 Days 02:31:55 RFx Owner Mr. Sims Harman Target Value 0.00 USD RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1
R Attribute Does the vendor accept the required contractusl te is mandstory; maintsin attribute value =
0 Attribute How long has your company been in business (Specif is mandstory; maintsin attribute value -
[ Submit| [[Read Onty | [ Print Preview | | [ Check || Export | [ Import | [ Questions and Answers (0] |
RFx Information - Items Notes and Attachments | Conditions |  Summary [ Tracking
| Basic Data Questions. Motes and Attschments ‘Conditions. Payment
Event Parameters Pricing Arrangement
Validity Period: Service and Delivery
Pricing As it:
Currancy: United States Dollar TR A
Target Value of RFx 0.00| USD Status and Statistics
Created On: 01/27/2014 10:58:06 C5T
Crested By: Ms. Golden Eagle
Last Processed On: 01/27/2014 10:58:06 CST
Last Processed By: Ms. Golden Eagle
W Partners and Delivery Information El
Details || Send E-Ma Ca Clear Filter Settings
Function Number Name Phone Number
= Location MS DEPT FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION
[Submit | [Clese | | [Read Onty | [Print Preview | | [Check | [Save | [Export | [ Import | [ Questions and Answers (D) |

Click Questions =UE5H00E 15 view the required buyer questions.

10.  Asrequired, complete/review the following fields:

Field R/O/C Description

How lona has vour | Reauired
company been in
business (Specify in Example:
years): 7

11. Click Yes ' ==,
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Create RFx Response

Create RFx Response

RFx Response Number S000000038

RFx Number 2120000231 Status In Process
Remaining Time 338 Days 02:31:55

RFx Owner Mr. Sims Harman Target Value 0.00 USD

o Attribute Does the vendor accapt the required contractual te is ma

datory; maintzin attribute value
0 Attribute How long has your company been in business (Specif is mandstory; maintsin attribute value

Submission Deadline 12/21/2014 13:30:00 CST
RFx Response Version Number Active Version

Opening Date 01/1V2015 00:00:00 CST
RFx Version Humber 1

Read Only | [ Frint Freview |

[Check | [ Save | [ Export | [ Import | [ Questions and Answers (0] |

=n

[ Read Onty | [ Print Preview |

[Gheck | [Save | [Export | [ Import | [ Questions and Answers (0) |

1 Items | Motes and Attschments Conditions | Summary | Tracking
| Basic Data | Questions | Notes and Attachments | Conditions | Payment
Question Reply Comment
How long has your company been in business (Specify in years): & YR
Does the vendor accept the reguired contractusl terms and conditions: & ® Yes No

12.
13.

Click Notes and Attachments
Click Items . ltem=

. Notes and Attachments

Create RFx Response

Create RFx Response

RFx Response Number 000000028

RFx Number 2180000251 Status In Process
Target Value 0.00 USD

RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Wersion Number 1

==

[Re=d Cnily | [ Print Preview | | [Check | [ Save | [Export | [ Import | [ Questions and Answers (0 |

RFx Information { Mems .  MNotes and

¥ Tracking
wr Item Overview

Submission Deadline 12/21/2014 12:20:00 CST

Opening Date 01/1v2015 00:00:00 CST

Remaining Tir

Details || ~
J[Cetar

Product Category ~ Product Category Description

Description  Variant Item Type  Product ID

Materizsl

sbrasive Abrasives Clothfiber

Required Quantity  Submitted Quantity ~ Unit
2

Price Curency Frice Per

z EA 0.00 USD 1

Total Vah

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase
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14. Click Details button[2==is_

Create RFx Response

Details for item abrasive

Item Data Questions. Motes and Attschments Fayment

w Basic Data

Identification

Item Typs: Material

Product Categony: 00514 Abrasives Clothfiber
Preduct 1D:

Drescription: shrazive

Item Variant Description:  Original Item

Supplier Product Number: |

Manufacturer Part Number:

Period of Parformance:

External Manufacturer:

Net value: .00
Acceptance at Origin:

Acceptance at Origin in RFx: [

w Partners and Delivery Information

Function

* Requester

‘Conditions Table Extensions. Delivery ‘Subcontracting
Currency: United States Dwollar
Required Cuantity': 2| EA esch
‘Submitted Quantity: EA_ |each
Price: [ 0.00] USD Per: | 1|Ea
Delivery Days: 000

Not to Exceed Price: [
Mot Separatehy Priced: [

Status and Statistics

Guaranteed Minimum Amount:

Number Name Phone Numb
Sims Harman 404-579-8122

[[Read Only |[ Print Preview | | [Check | [Export | [ Import | [ Questions and Answers (0)
A

15. As required, complete/review the following fields:

Field R/O/C Description

Price:

Required
Example:

2500

Delivery Days:

Required
Example:

10

Supplier
Product
Number:

Required
Example:

123 abc 9

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase
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Create RFx Response

| »

-mlmmmlwlmlemﬂmiM-uyimm

MNotes and Attachments

AETITEIEY Cumency: Unitad States Dollar
iz Required Quantity: [ 2[EAcan
Froduct Category: 00514 ives Clothfiber ‘Submitted Quantity: [ Z[[EA Jesn
Froduct ID: [ | Pz 2500| USD Fer: 1]Ea
Description: |abrasive | T
Item Variant Description:  Original Item Mot to Excesd Price: O
Supplier Product Number: [123_abc_9 | IR R O
Part Number: Status and Statistics
Period of | - Minimum Amount] __ 0.00]
Extemal Manufacturer: | |
Net vae
Acceptance at Origin: O
Acoceptance at Origin in RFx: []
Function Number Name Phone Mumbs
= Requester Sims Harman 404-5T9-9122
|| [Fe=s Goly | [Frint Freview] | [Sheck | [Save | [Export | [Impert | [Guestions and Answers (0] | |

4l 3

16. Click Notes and Attachments tab = Metes and Attachments

Create RFx Response

Line Number Description Variant Item Type Product 1D Product Category | Product Category Descripth ired Quantity itted Quantity Unit  Price Cumency Price Per  Total Value L

ftem Data | CQuestions _ oy | Condit | Table i | Deivery | Subcontracting
Category Description
Bidder's Remarks -Empty-
Purchssers Remarks -Empty-
| ~Empty-
[Add [ Edit D iption |[ ioning 4 || Delete |[ Create Profile |
Category Description File Name Version Frocessor Checked Out Type Size (KB)

[E] The table does not contain any data

| [R=a8 Oniy | [[Print Preview | | [Check | [Save | [Export | [ import | [Guestions and Answers (07 | -
>l

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase Page 8



17. Click Bidder's Remarks 2dd="= femars
Add Bidder's Remarks

Add Bidder's Remarks =l E3

Bidder's Rlemarks: |

18. As required, complete/review the following fields:

Field R/O/C Description

Bidder's Remarks: | Required

Example:

We can deliver products with in 10 days

Add Bidder's Remarks

Add Bidder's Remarks =l E3

Bidder's Remarks: |We can defiver products with in 10 days |

[K] [Coree |

19.  Click ok [®%] .

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase Page 9



Create RFx Response

Line Mumber Description  Variant  [tem Type Product ID Product Category  Product Category Description  Required Quantity — Submitted Quantity  Unit Price  Cumency Price Per  Total Value
|—. &E  abmsive Material 00514 Abrasives Clothfiber 2 2EA 250000 USD 1 5000 |

|mnmimmm—|hynmlc«mlmhmmimineimyimm

B e
J RFx/Auction Text Empty-
|— T — . rSp—— with in 10 days
J FPurchssers Remarks -Empty-
Justification -Empty-
| e |
[Aad || Edit Description || Versioning || Delete | Create Profile |
Category Deescription File Mame Version Frocessor Checked Out Typs Sizs (KE)
[3] The table does not contsin any data

[«]

| [Resd Only | [Prnt Previewr] | [Chesk | [Save | [Export | [Import | [Guestions and Answers (0] |
E————=t.) ,

20. Click Add Attachment[#32 Attachment]
Add Attachment

Here, you can upload a file and attach it to the s=lect=d tem

21.  Click| Bows=.. |

Choose File to Upload

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase Page 10



"@ Choose File to lw_‘-

(" ) (’-" ) Twl‘_?"'l Search Documents §e) '
Organize ¥ New folder * Al ® |
A admin D - |
’ i ocuments “brary Arrange by: Folder ¥
i Andeond Includes: 2 locations ge by
.. AppData =
53 Contacts | LOG820_GHANGE_RFx_RESPONSE }_;; .
s Desktop | LOGB20_CREATE_BID_RESPONSE T
& Downloads |, LOG820_QUESTION
(7] Dropbox = . LOG800_SUP_REG
{ Favorites |, LOG800_SUPPLIER_REG
& Google Drive |, LOG_SUS_OWN_DATA
@ Links . LOG_SUS_CHANGE_COMPANY_INFO II
| My Document: . LOG_SUS_FIND_USER
W My Music .. Mobogenie ]
=/ My Pictures . Optimizer Pro
|| My Videos I AVGO E
File name: | - [AII Files (*.%) ,]
[ Open ] [ Cancel ]
ﬁ

22. Click Page down 4.

23. Click Book2axlsx

24.

Add Attachment

Here, you can uplead a file and attach it to the sslected item

Click Open .

File:

[C:\Wsers\admin\Decund [ Browes. ...

B[t |

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase
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25. As required, complete/review the following fields:

Field R/O/C Description

Description:

Required

Example:

Product List

26. Click OK [9¥¢

Create RFx Response

Line Mumber Description  Variant  Item Type Product ID

Product Category  Product Category Description  Required Quantity — Submitted Quantity  Unit

Price Cumency Price Per  Total Value

- ﬁ El abrasive Material Abrasives Clothfiber 2 2 EA  2.500.00 USD 1 5,000.00
Details for item abrasive
Item Diats Questions Notes and Attachments Payment Conditions. Table Extensions Deliveny Subcontracting
w Notes
Clear || Copy
Category Description
RFxifwction Text -Empty-
Bidder's Remarks We can deliver products with in 10 days
~Empty-
~Empty-
Category Description File Mame Version Processor Checked Out Type Size (HB)
Standard Attachment PRODUCT LIST Book2.xlsx 1 n xsx 11
[ Read Onty | [ Print Preview | | [{Check | [ Excport | [ Import | [ Questions and Answers { 0) -
4 | ST

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase

27. Click Check | Eheck ]
28. Click Submit [52mi]
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End of simulation.

Display RFx Response 6000000038 |

RFx Response Number 8000000028 RFx Number 2180000251 Status Submitted Submission Deadline 12/21/2014 12:20:00 CST Opening Date 01/10/2015 00:00:06 CST Remaining Time
Target Value 0.00 USD RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1

RFxrﬁponse&msihﬁmed|

(] [e] | [Prerrevew] | [ | [t | [ | [Gomsions s Arewes 107

| |
e st Vs 1Ty P 0 Pk Gy P ey s ey Sty s Gy Tt

&l =l

mmim_wlmlmtmimim

29. End of simulation.

You have successfully submitted an RFx response to the State of Mississippi.

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase Page 13



Section IV

Special Instructions

The following section provides a DFA MAGIC Reverse Auction Bidder’s Training Guide. It
includes detailed instructions on how to access the reverse auction event, including how to gain
access to the system utilized and what technical requirements may be involved. However, no
supplier may be prohibited from participating in person by paper through surrogate bidding.

MAGIC Reverse Auction
Bidders Training Guide

D

<

EAGe
LR

* —
Hlisssipl's Acspurabity Sysem or GovernmentInfomefion and Colaboraon

The MAGIC Reverse Auction Bidders Training Guide provides instructions for vendors to
participate in Reverse Auctions. Vendors have the ability to submit bids electronically and view
real time bid ranking. The identity of participating bidders will not be displayed to other bidders
throughout the online auction process. However, bidders will be able to see the current best
bid.

Contents
Technical Requirements
Login Procedure
View Available Reverse Auctions
Search for Auction(s)
Display Auction Details
Display Line Iltems
Display Notes and Attachments
Participating in a Live Auction
Live Auction Cockpit
Chat and System Messages

Pausing and/or Resuming an Auction

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase Page 14



MAGIC Reverse Auction Bidders Guide

Technical Requirements

Bidders are responsible for ensuring technical requirements are met.

Acceptable Internet Browser(s)

=~ <@ Microsoft Internet Explorer (IE) version 11
~B«@ Google Chrome versions 49 and above (will need to download and install a
Chrome Extension called “IE Tab Extension”)

Unsupported Internet Browser(s)

=~ 8@ Microsoft Internet Explorer (IE) version 10 or below
= &< Microsoft Edge

~“B<@ Google Chrome

~w@<@ Safari

B«  Firefox

Note: Pop-up blocker must be turned off.

Java

B« Reverse Auction requires Java version 6.30 or higher. Java can be downloaded
from following Web site.
https://www.java.com/en/download/

y Sy B Goenment sbetin 7

Login Procedure

Vendors must be registered in MAGIC in order to receive a User ID and password to log in.
Vendors who are new to MAGIC may visit the Vendor Information page on DFA’s Web Site, or
register online, Vendor Registration.

To Log into MAGIC, open the following URL: https://portal.magic.ms.gov/irj/portal. Enter User 1D
and Password. The password is case sensitive.

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase Page 15


https://www.java.com/en/download/
http://www.dfa.ms.gov/dfa-offices/mmrs/mississippi-suppliers-vendors/
https://sus.magic.ms.gov/sap/bc/webdynpro/sapsrm/wda_e_suco_sreg?sap-client=100
https://portal.magic.ms.gov/irj/portal

Having password problems? Please
\. L dick on this link for help...

usc s Aopurtabity Sysen i Goemnent lomain

User *

Password *

MAGIC is the Mississippi Accountabiity System Log On
for Government Information and Coliaboration.

If you need access oradditionalinformation
please gotothe below website.
h

-/ /vewew. dfa ms gov/dfa-offices/mmrs

MAGIC Reverse Auction Bidders Guide

View Available Reverse Auctions
Search for Auction(s)
Listed below are the steps to search for a bid response.

1.) Bidders must first respond to the RFx (RFQF) to be able to participate in the
Reverse Auction. Instructions for creating a response to an RFx are available here,
RFx Response -Supplier Self Service.

e The RFx (RFQF)- Bid Specifications will provide details for qualifying criteria.
Only bidders qualified through the RFx (RFOF) will be invited to participate in
Reverse Auctions.

2.) To search for auctions, click on the Suppliers Self-Service tab.

3.) Select RFx and Auctions in the navigation menu on the left of the screen. 4.)

Select the Published link on the eAuctions line of the Active Queries section.

Note: If the search fields are not visible, click the [»_Show Quick Criteria Maintenance | button to
expand the search criteria.
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http://uperform.magic.ms.gov/gm/folder-1.11.7512?originalContext=1.11.8507

i
DAL C
1 Vessgpis kehahley Sy by Covement s nd oo

History View Help

Home Procurement Suppliers Self-Service

Supplier Self-Service Work Center Administration
4 Suppliers Seli-Service > Supplier Self-Service Work Center > RFx and Auctions
Work Center Overview

Supplier Self-Service Work Ce... Active Queries

RFx and Auctions eRFxs All(0) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0)
Pithase Ordere eAuctions Al (1)} Published (1) knded (4) Completed (0)

eAuctions - Published

| » Show Quick Criteria Maintenance |

~Vew: [[olandard Vew] ¥ || Deplay Event Display Bid | Print Pre

‘ E- Event Number Event Description

MAGIC Reverse Auction Bidders Guide

5.) Enter the search criteria. To find all available bid opportunities, skip to step (f).

A. Select All or Published to search for available Events (eAuctions).

B. Enter the appropriate Quick Criteria Maintenance fields: Event Number (Auction
number) or complete any optional relevant search criteria.

C. Click on Apply to view all Auctions based on your search criteria.

D. To generate an updated search using the same selection criteria, click Refresh
or skip to step (7).

6.) Click Apply to find available bid opportunities.

7.) In the results list, click on the Event Number to open the Auction details in a separate
window. (Pop-up blocker must be turned off.)

3 -
1 Vessgpis ket Sy Covenmest et nd oo
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l' | ;‘“‘ H l {_1 Mississippi Accountability System for Government Information and Collaboration

‘ Log

Welcome: VNDS050881

History Favorites View Help

= ot = = = =

lome Employee Self-Service Suppliers Self-Service General Applications System Administration

[_.’—‘
H Content Management User Administration
Supplier Self-Service Work Center Administration

4  Suppliers Seli-Service = Supplier Self-Service Work Center = RFx and Auctions Full Scree

Work Center Overview

Supplier Self-Service Work Ce... Active Queries

RFx and Auctions

Purchase Orders I eAuctions All(1) Published (1) Ended (0) Completed (0) l

eAuctions - All

|  Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance Change Query Define New Query Personaliize
Event Humber: =l 3300000092 L I
Event Status: L [
Creaton Date: ° o ®
Deadine Date Flag: L ™
Status: L [
My RFx Resp From: -
Smart Humber:
Clear |
View: |[Standard View] - | Display Event Display Bid | Print Preview I Refresh txpur‘t 4 E;

Event Number  Event Description Event Type Event Status  Start Date End Date Bid Number Bid Status
3300000092 1130-18-R-RAEX-00002 English Auction = Active 102062017 1002702017 No Bid Created

MAGIC Reverse Auction Bidders Guide

Display Auction Details

Listed below are the steps view the auction details and information regarding the auction.

1.) The Auction Details screen will be displayed. It is important to review the details prior

to the Auction begin time. Bidding will not be available prior to the Auction Start Date /
Time.

The table below list the fields and a brief description of the information available on the Auction
Parameters sub-tab of the Auction Information tab.
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' IAG:

Display Auction: 3300000092
[ Print Preview | | | [ close || Live Auction |

3 Days 11:41:05 Number 3300000092

Remaining Time

Start Date 20.10.2017 13:58:45 CST

Auction Information } tems |

Name 1130-18-R-RAEX-00002

Owner First Last Status Active usD

End Date 27.10.2017 01:00:00 CST

Currency

Notes and Attachments

Auction Parameters Notes and Attachments

Identification Event Parameters
Name: 1130-18-R-RAEX-00002 Bid Decrement: Absolute
Type: English Auction Bid Validation: New bid must beat overall best bid
Product Category: Foliow On Document: Contract
Currency: usD Sequential Line ltems: O
Sequential Initial Duration: 0
Dates Sequential End-Time Gap: 0
Start Date: 10/20/2017 01:58:45 pm
Automatic Extensions:
End Date: 10/27/2017 01:00:00 am Remaining Time Trigger: 0
Time Zone: CsT Extension Period: 0
Number of Extensions: 0
Status and Statistics
Creation Date: 10/03/2017 | 04:27:46 pm
Created By: SRMBUYER04
Section Field Name Description
Identification| Name Smart Number with details related to the RFx
Type English Auction is the standard for State of Mississippi
Product Category The 5 digit NIGP code (optional)
Currency US Dollar (USD)
Dates Start Date Begin Date and Time for the Live Auction
End Date Date and Time of Live Auction completion
Time Zone Central Standard Time (CST)
Event Bid Decrement The amount/percentage by which the next bid must
Parameter decrease relevant to the current lowest hid
s Bid Validation Logic used to determine if the bid is valid.
Follow On Document Contract or Purchase Order
Sequential Line ltems | Enables sequential line item functionality to
stanner end times
Sequential Initial The amount of time in between each line item end time.
Sequential End-Time The time between item end times.
Automatic | Remaining Time Trigger| The time period before the end of the auction where an

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase
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Extensions extension can be triggered due to bid activity.

Extension Period Number of minutes, for which the auction will be
extended if a bidder submits an offer within the

Daomaininn Tima Trinnar narind

Number of Extensions | The number of times an auction can be extended
hv hid activitv within the Remainina Time Triaaer

Status Creation Date The date and time the auction was created.

and Created By The UserID of the Agency Buyer who created the

Display Line Items

Listed below is information regarding the line items associated with the auction.
1.) Click the Items tab to view the line items.

Display Auction: 3300000092

| Print Preview| | | |Close || Live Auction | "!‘n

3 Days 11:41:05 Number 3300000092 Hame 1130-18-R-RAEX-00002 Owner First Last Status Active Currency USD
Start Date 20.10.2017 13:58:45 CST End Date 27.10.2017 01:00:00 CST

Remaining Time
Auction Information Items Notes and Attachments
w ltem Overview |j
Copy || Paste Expand All Collapse Al Fiter Setfings

E. Line Number Kem Type ProductlD Descripion Lot CQuantity Unit StartPrice Bid Decrement Amount Delivery Date Nmes@ Attachments =

= 1 Material TEST M1 1,000 AU 10.000,00 10,00 oo oia
- 2 Material TEST 02 1,000 AU 10.000,00 10,00 oo oia
- 3 Material TEST 03 1,000 EA 10.000,00 10,00 oo o/0
. 4 Material TEST 04 1,000 EA 10.000,00 10,00 o/ o/o

If the items are in Lots, the main items will be listed with individual lot items below.

Mumber 300003165 Meme VIMIERSFUO00N  Type EnglonAuchon  Staus Swed  Numberof Sdders 11
Auconinfommoor | Daders Remb | NowssrgAmCATess | Diser View Tracking
W been Ovecview
Outals § Add Reew , | Cogy | Fasss | Dhglcate || Detete
B Lie Nurtes e Type Noduct © Descrpton Lot Pduct Caseeey Quntty S e Rtarence e Reservn Mice Free Une B0 Decremn
v1 LFRONS v 0w 0% 080
st enal g 1 . A ¢
el oo Y0004 woeA
Mresal Medum 10004 00 EA
= NFORL 2 i o) 0%
Mtoral 20 10004 00ER oo
Mesal et 10004 wo e 06
Mtesal 1 = 08
- v 0%
Matoral 10004 e 0o
Hhatess) ¥ &
oy 10004 &

2.) To view additional details for a line item, select the desired line and click the
button.
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Display Auction: 3300000092

| Print Previewl | | |Close || Live Auction | ﬁ!

3 Days 11:41:05 Number 3300000092 Mame 1130-18-R-RAEX-00002 Owner First Last Status Active Currency UsD
Start Date 20.10.2017 13:58:45 CST End Date 27.10.2017 01:00:00 CST

Remaining Time:
Auction Information ltems ]’ Motes and Attachments
w ltem Overview |f|
Copy || Paste Expand All Collapse Al Fiter Settings

Unit  Start Price  Bid Decrement Amount
10.000,00

Delivery Date

Attachments |+
1

2 ] 0.000,00 10,00 uro uro
= 3 Material TEST 03 1,000 EA 10.000,00 10,00 0ra 0/ 0
4 Material TEST 04 1,000 EA 10.000,00 10,00 o/ 0/ 0

3.) The detalils for the line item will be displayed.
M| Hem 1 : TEST 01 (]
Item Data Notes and Attachments

Idenfification Currency, Values and Pricing

ltem Type: Material Quantity / Unit; 1,000 AU

Product ID; Price Per Unit 1| Activity unit

Description: TESTO1 Start Price: 10.000,00| USD

Product Category: 86300 Ceiing Price: 0,00/ USD ]
Bid Decrement Percent; 0,00

The table below list the fields and a brief description of the information available for each line
item

Section Field Name Description
Identificatio | Item Name Type of item (Material)
n Product ID 11 digit material number
Description Detailed description of the item
Product Category The 5 digit NIGP code
Currency, | Quantity /Unit The number of items / the Unit of Measure (i.e.
Values, i i EA far each)
and Price Per Unit The individual price based on the Unit of
Pricing _ Measure indicated i i :
Start Price Starting bid price of the item (Bids higher than the
start nrice will not he accented )
Ceiling Price Ceiling Price is not used.
Bid Decrement Bid decrement amount if percentage option is
Bid Decrement Bid decrement amount if dollar amount
ontion is selected
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Display Notes and Attachments

Click the Notes and Attachments tab to view supporting documents and/or notes
associated with the auction.

Display Auction: 3300000092

| Print Preview | | | | Close || Live Auction |

3 Days 11:31:45 Number 3300000082 Name 1130-18-R-RAEX-00002 Owner First Last Status Active Currency USD
Start Date 20.10.2017 13:58:45 C5T End Date 27.10.2017 01:00:00 CST

Remaining Time:
Auction Information ©  tems /I Notes and Atbuchmentsl
w lNotes
Add Clear
Assigned To  Category Text Preview
w Attachments
Add Attachment || Edit Descripfion || Versioning Delete || Create Qualification Profie
Assigned To Category Descriptien File Name Version  Processor Checked OQut  Type Size (KB)  Changed by
Document Header Standard Attachment test 3160000714 MHTML 1 | MHTML 55 SRMBUYERD4

Participating in a Live Auction

After completing the steps above to find a desired auction, the steps below can be used to
participate in the Live Auction process.

1.) With the Auction displayed, click the Live Auction button.
Display Auction: 3300000092

[pontprevew] | %] | [Cosef[ihe Aucton ]

3Da}.311:25:52 Number 3300000092 Mame 1130-15-R-RAEX-00002 Owner First Last Status Active Currency USD

- Start Date 20.10.2017 13.58:45 C5T End Date 27.10.2017 01:00:00 C5T
Remaining Time

Auctinnlnfnrmatinn” tem=s -~ MNotes and Attachments

2.) A pop-up window will appear containing Terms and Conditions to participate in the Live
Auction. Review all terms and conditions. If you agree, click Accept. If you click Decline
you will not be allowed to participate in the Live Auction.

RFQF- Glock Trade-In/Purchase Page 22



Terms and Conditions

Thase are the condtons of paticipation. Do you Accept?

If the agency did not establish Terms and Conditions this screen will not be displayed.

'NAGIC

sssappis Arhizhlty Sysem fr Coverment et and ot
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3.) If any pop-ups appear asking for a confirmation to run the JAVA application, click Run.

Do you want to run this application?

Publisher: SAP AG

(fla

2

-

Location: https://srmugq.magic.ms.gov

This application will run with unrestricted access which may put your computer and personal
information at risk. Run this application only if you trust the location and publisher above.

[ Do not show this again for apps from the publisher and location above

g More Information [ Run ] [ Cancel J

=

4.) The Live Auction bidding screen will be displayed. If you receive any error messages,
please ask your company’s system administrator to verify your computer’s technical
requirements.

Live Auction Cockpit
The Live Auction Cockpit will be displayed when the JAVA application has run.

Listed below is information regarding key items for the Live Auction Cockpit. The steps for
submitting a response are located on the next page.
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Live Auction Cockpit

Name: 1130-18-R-RFQI-00030 Requester: 1130_SRMBOS1

Number: 3300000163 Currency: USD Start Date: 08/23/2017 10:38:30 AM CDT
Rule Profile: Reverse auction with broken lot, full quantity, anonymous bidding End Date: 08/23/2017 10:50:00 AM CDT
Description: Time Remaining: 00:08:06 (Active)

tem Description Quantity Unit Price Unit StartPrice Decrement Rank MyBid My Bid Value BestBid NextValid Bid Bid Price

- 00 ea 9.00 0.00 0.00
2 Pens 200|Case 1 20.00] - - - - 11.00 11.00
3 Folders 300|Pail 1 29.00] - - - - 22.00; 22.00
4 Books 400/Drum 1 34.00 - - - - 28.00] 28.00]

Total Value of M

ttem 1
Detals Description Pencils
=== | Quantity 100
Unit each

Price Unit 1

Charts Currency usb

Start Price 19.00

Calculation | | Decrement 0.00

Revision Level

Supplier Text
MAGIC Reverse Auction Bidders Guide

Field Name Description

Start Date Date and Time the Live Auction starts

End Date Date and Time the Live Auction ends

Time Remaining The time remaining for the Live Auction

Description Line item description

Quantity Line item quantity

Unit Line item unit

Price Unit Line item price per unit

Start Price The initial price for the line item.

Best Bid The lowest bid that has been submitted, to date, for that
line item This field will he hlank nntil the first hid has heen

Next Valid Bid The next price that is allowed to be bid for that line item. It is
determined by subtracting the decrement amount from the
hact hid amaniint

Bid Price Your bid for the item. Your bid should be equal or less than the
next valid bid field.
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Submitting a Bid Response
The steps below must be completed for each separate line item you wish to bid on.

1. Click desired line item.
2. Enter the price in the Bid Price field(s) for the items you wish to bid on.

: — E@
" ssagpis Krhuadly Sy Gt et nd okt

7
|

Live Auction Cockpit o EI;’
Name: 1130-18-R-RFQF-00025 Requester: 1130_SRMBOS1
Number: 3300000120 Currency. USD Start Date: 1016/2017 10:06:00 AM COT
Rule Profile: Reverse auction with broken lof, full guantity, anonymeus bidding End Date: 10M9/2017 9:59:00 AM COT
Description: Time Remaining:  00:00:00 (Ended) (;?
ftem = Description Quantty Unit Price Unit ~ Start Price Decrement Rank MyBid My Bid Value BestBid MNextValid Bid § Bid Price

Test Material 01 10 each 1 = 100000 1000 1 660.00 £,600.00 , 660.00 650.00
2 [TestMaterial 02 12|gach 1) O 1,000.00
3 [Test Material 03 15]each [ ois000] 1000 1 13,050.00] § 870.00] 260.00]

est Waterial 04 20]each 1 ozooom] o] 1 [ ar2o0]  7.4e000] § er200] 862.00)

Total Value of My Bids 45,010.00 Total Bid Value: Submit
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3. Click the Submit button. The submit button may be submitted after each line item price
is entered or after you enter the price for all line items you wish to bid on.

Live Auction Cockpit e E:! D .
Name: 1130-18-R-RFQF-00025 Requester: 1130_SRMBOS1

Number: 3300000120 Currency: USD Start Date: 10/16/2017 10:06:00 AM COT

Rule Profile: Reverse auction with broken lot, full quantity, anonymous bidding End Date: 10/18/2017 9:59:00 AM CDT

Description: Time Remaining:  00:00:00 (Ended) (;?)

ttem  Description Quantity Unit Price Unit  StartPrice Decrement Rank MyBid My Bid Value BestBid Next Valid Bid Bid Price
Test Material 01 10 each 1 ™ 1,000.00 10.00 1 660.00 6,600.00 650.00

2 [Test Material 02 12|each 1| O 1,000.00 10.00] 1 £60.00 7,920.00] § 660 650.00

[Test Material 03 15each 1| O 1,500.00 10.00] 1 870.00 13,050.00 860.00

4 [Test Material 04 20/each 1| O 2,000.00 10.00] 1 872,00 17,440.00| § 872.0 862.00
Total Value of My Bids 45,010.00 Total Bid Value:

4. A confirmation pop-up window will be displayed. The bid value (by line item) will be
display the total of the Unit Price times the Quantity for that item. If the bid amount(s)
are correct, click Yes. If the bid amount(s) are incorrect, click No and repeat the
steps above to enter the correct bid amounts.

Lnve Acchon Coclpet x

] e You 008 0004t 15 Sa0eet & total B vakue of 10,000 00 USD for Me folowing tems

femd 10200000 USD

| Thes cpaiaton cannot be undone Do yov want 10 continue ™
1 VG

5.) A confirmation of a successful bid submission will be displayed in the Chat Window.

Note: Erroneous bids may be deleted by the agency during the live auction.

Chat and System Messages

08072017 102740 AN CDT [System]. “our bid for line item 1 has been successfuly submitted
08072017 10:27.40 AN CDT [System]. “our bid for line item 2 has been successfuly submitted
08/0FI2017 10:27.40 AM CDT [Sy=tem]: “our bid for line item 3 has been successfuly =ubmitted

6.) Repeat steps 1 — 5 for each desired line item.
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Chat and System Messages

The Chat and System Messages area is used for viewing chat messages from an agency
buyer and information messages automatically generated by MAGIC.

Below are helpful hints in using the chat feature:

A bidder CAN: Send a message to an agency buyer.

See broadcast mes'sag']es from the égency 'bu"yér to ALL bidders.
See messages regarding the status of the auction (e.g.
natised resumed or extended)

A bidder CANNOT: | Send a message to other bidders of the auction.
See messages sent to an agency by other bidders.
See messages sent to other bidders from the agency buyer.

Chat and System Messages Participating Bidders 5 Purchaser Status Offine Display Time Stamp | All Messages W

leaze send me.... | Send
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Pausing and/or Resuming an Auction

If necessary, the agency buyer can pause the Live Auction bidding. In such cases, the
auction status will be changed from “Active” to “Paused”. A system alert will appear on
the screen.

Live Auction Cockpit &J

':0:‘ Auction status has changed from Active to Paused

The countdown clock will not stop running while the auction is paused. The

ime remaining and en ime aren ff [ exten matically.

;f.[‘ﬁ*&[(}

Msssapps crrizhlty Sysem fr Coverment et and oot

When the agency buyer resumes the auction the auction status will be changed from
“Paused” to “Active”. A system alert will appear on the screen.

-
Live Auction Cockpit &J

':0:' Auction status has changed from Paused to Active

Once the auction has ended, a notification will display.

L]

Live Auction Cockpit *

::' Auction status has changed from Active to Ended
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